BID NUMBER: BL139-25

BID DESCRIPTION:

Resurfacing of Residential County Roads on a Term
Contract

BID OPENING DATE: 10.20.25

OPENING DATE CHANGE #1: 12.12.2025

PURCHASING ASSOCIATE: Michael Milstein

BIDS/PROPOSALS RECEIVED

DOLLAR AMOUNT

ALLIED PAVING CONTRACTORS, INC

District 1: $6,024,205.50
District 2: $5,926,560.50
District 3: $6,163,093.00
District 4: $7,651,072.50
District 5: $8,177,115.00
District 6: $5,930,291.75

Blount Construction Company Inc

District 1: $5,431,993.83
District 2: $5,917,562.69
District 3: $5,415,147.65
District 4: $7,173,879.04
District 5: $7,491,315.48
District 6: $5,609,352.82

E.R. Snell Contractor, Inc

District 1: $6,256,135.00
District 2: $7,097,346.40
District 3: $7,141,617.00
District 4: $8,051,232.00
District 5: $9,239,114.00
District 6: $6,692,624.75

East Coast Grading, Inc

District 1: $5,764,748.00
District 2: $5,624,663.00
District 3: $5,681,131.00
District 4: $7,305,486.00
District 5: $7,659,937.00
District 6: $5,472,581.25

Magnum paving

District 1: $6,163,462.00
District 2: $5,888,742.00
District 3: $6,024,315
District 4: $7,826,709.00
District 5: $7,931,296.75
District 6: $5,819,044.50

MHB PAVING

District 1: $7,834,315.82
District 2: $7,6969,177.24
District 3: $7,792,064.10
District 4: $9,432,651.99
District 5: $9,639,348.55
District 6: $7,040,435.07

Pittman Construction Company

District 1: No Bid
District 2: No Bid
District 3: $7,046,557.95
District 4: No Bid
District 5: $9,208,857.70
District 6: No Bid

SUMMIT CONSTRUCTION & DEVELOPMENT, LLC

District 1: $6,184,247.20
District 2: $6,001,432.00
District 3: $6,012,310.00
District 4: $7,793,468.55
District 5: $7,968,195.00
District 6: $5,903,571.50

The Scruggs Company dba Sunbelt Asphalt Services,
Inc

District 1: $5,720,167.00
District 2: $5,150,757.00
District 3: $5,283,801.00
District 4: $6,744,028.60
District 5: $7,116,692.00
District 6: $4,907,475.00
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